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FUTURE READY
INSTITUTES

MAGNET SCHOOL

INSTITUTES BEGIN 
IN 9TH GRADE

SCHOOL HOURS:
9:00A - 4:00P

EXECUTIVE PRINCIPAL:
DR. TIFFANY EARVIN

BUS TRANSPORTATION
OPTIONS AVAILABLE

EPB Institute of Technology &
Networking 
UTC Institute of Teaching & Learning
Institute of Health Sciences 

Tyner Academy is a high-performing
school dedicated to the success of all
learners. With an enrollment of 550
students that range from 9th to 12th
grade, we have a dynamic faculty and
staff committed to making a difference
in students' lives every day. 21st-century
skills are embedded throughout a
student's course curriculum. We are a
1:1 school that incorporates technology
into daily studies. Located in the heart
of the Tyner community, Tyner
Academy is a magnet school and home
of three Future Ready Institutes.
Students have a team of stakeholders
working collaboratively to support their
post-secondary success.

FUTURE READY INSTITUTES: 

FRI PARTNERS: University of Tennessee
at Chattanooga, Electric Power Board,
Parkridge Hospital

Missionary Ridge Learning Community

TAYLOR_V@HCDE.ORG

TYNERACADEMY.HCDE.ORG

TYNER ACADEMY

@HCSFUTUREREADY
@TYNERUPPER
@TA_FUTUREREADY

FUTURE READY INSTITUTES @

TYNER ACADEMY


